
 

BANK      DETAILS  
 

BANK ADDRESS    :  ORCHID PLAZA , RAJARHAT , 
KOLKATA - 700 135 , W.B ( INDIA )

BANK  NAME         :  HDFC  BANK 

BANK A / C  NO     :  50200052950522

I F S CODE              :  HDFC0001129

SWIFT  CODE         :  HDFCINBBCAL

PHONE NO             : + 91 7573919585

BANK EMAIL          :  support@hdfcbank.com

ORDER
We will appreciate your valued order in advance to keep 
delivery schedule on time . While ordering, please clearly 
mention our product name and along with its product 
number.

PRICE

mailto:support@hdfcbank.com


Prices quoted against each product on F.O.B basis (excluding 
sea freight / air freight, insurance etc…) offered prices are 
subjected to change without prior notice or information, 
however please always try to send us the list of your required 
products, we will send you best possible competitive price 
every time as per your required quantity and products.

PAYMENT
In view of exchange control regulation, all shipping documents
have to be routed through banking channels. As such all 
shipping documents will be forwarded to HDFC customer's 
bank account for collection of payment. To avoid high bank 
charges, customers can send us the deposit of 50% advance 
payment against their purchase order with us and balance 
50% against the bill of lading, then after we will send all the 
original shipping documents direct to the customer's office.

PACKAGING
All items are packed in bulk packaging (plain poly bags). 
Items can be packed with custom header card (customer's 
brand packaging). Individual packaging are chargeable 
separately into customer's account as well. Customer's are 
requested while ordering please specify with your requirement
(packaging).




